ANNEX B

Department of Public Works & Highways, Regional Office XI, Davao City

PROCUREMENT MONITORING REPORT - as of JUNE 30, 2019

Actual Procurement Activity ABC (PhP) Contract Cost (PhP) Date of Receipt of Invitation Femadk
lemarks
Code PROCUREMENT PMO/ Mode of Pre-bid Source of List of Invited Delivery/ (Explaining
(UACSI PAP) PROGRAWPROJECT End-User Procurement Pre-Proc Ads/ Post Confsiond Eligibility | Submission/ Bid Post Qual Notice of | Contract [Noticeto| Delivery/ |Inspection&| Funds Total MOOE co Total MOOE co Observers Pre-bid | Eligibility | Sub/Open Bid Post | Completion/ | changes from
Conference of ITB o Check |OpenofBids | Evaluation Award Signing | Proceed | Completion | Acceptance Conference | Check of Bids | Evaluation | Qual | Acceptance the APP)
(if applicable)
COMPLETED PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES
SRR018.01-002247 5GLO0021: JO; Catering Services JADMIN Public Bidding z 252018] - | 2/12018] _ 272019] _ 2/4r2019] 2062019] 218201 01101101 99,000.00 99,00000 | 96.250.00 96,250.00 |CONPICPAIDCCC
R2018-02.002962 5L00022: JO: Catering Services |ADMIN Public Bidding - o2072019] - | 22812019 2/28/2019] __3/172019] 3/4r2019] 31134201 01101101 80,100.00 30,100.00 | __79.922.00 165,984.00 |COAPICPADCCC
R2018.01-002247 GLO0023: JO: Repair Vehicle __[PAIO Public Bidding z §112019) - [ 319720 192019] 3212019 32212019| 416201 01101101 193,186.60 193,186.60 | _193.186.46 193,186.46 |COAPICPAIDCCC =
[SR2018-02.005849 GLO0024: JO: Repair Vehicle __|PDD & QAHD |Public Bidding - 3192019] - | 3126/2019] 3262019 312872019 a2872019] 41177201 1101101 128.780.17 128780.17 | 12851164 128,511.64 [COAPICPADCCC
_|SRe018-01-002247 1 iing Services _|ADMIN Public Bidding : 192019] - | 312612019 3262019 No bid 1101101 500,000.00 £00,000.01 . -~ [coaPIcCPADCCC
R2018-02-002962 19GL00026: JO: Catering Services [ADMIN Public Bidding : 3192019] - | 3/26/2019] _3/26/2019] _3/28/2019] 312972019] /1672019 1101101 112,500.00 112,500.00 |__108.500.00 108,500.00 |COAPICPAIDCCC
SR2018-01-00224 19GL0027: JO: Printing Services_|PAIO Public Bidding i 26019 - | 4/r019] _ 4552019] 41122019 411512019] 4252019 1101101 180,000.00 80,000.00 | _179,004.00 179,004.00 |COAPICPADCCC
SR2018.01-00224 19GLO0028: JO: Mailing Services ®| ADMIN Public Bidding = 4B019] - | 4121019] 4121201 No bid submi 1101101 £00,000.00 500,000.00 : ~ |COAPICPAIDCCC
SR2018-01-00224 19GL00029: AVR ADMIN Public Bidding - 4512019 - 41127201 41121201 No bid 1101101 249,000.00 49,000.00 E - |coaricPaDCCC
|§m1w1mzz47 19GL00030: JO: Repair Vehicle LEE(;ASLT Public Bidding - 4n3R019— sonot9|  sr0t9| ser018| 5320 O:w :“I 15194842 |— 15194842 | 14650463 —— 14550463 |coaPicPADCCE
[sRe018-02-005849 19GLO0031: JO: Repair Vehicle _|PDD [ Public Bidding - a232018] - | 5PR019] _5Rr019 No bid submi 01101101 70,189.42 70,189.42 CONPICPAIDCCC
SR2018-01-002247 19GL00032: ID CARD CONSUM,_|ADMIN Public Bidding . 402019] - | 57R019] 57019 5/e2019] 572019] 572212019 01101101 106.700.00 106,700.00 | _ 96,600.00 96,600.00 |CONPICPADCCC
SR2018-01-002247 19GL00033: JO: Repair Vehicle __|CONST,___|Public Bidding : 5o2019] - | 5/102019] _5/10/201 No bid subrmi 01101101 83,449.75 83,449.75 CONPICPADCCC
SR2018.01-002423 19GLO0034: JO: Catering Services |ADMIN Public Bidding i 5/9/2019| 5/1772019]_6/612019] _6/6/2019] _ 6/1172019]6/13/2019] 77872019 01101101 2,000,000.00 2,000,000.00 | 1.800,000.00 1,800,000.00 |CONPICPADCCC
SR2018.02.005849 19GL00035: JO: Repair Vehicle__|PDD Public Bidding : 02019] - | 5172019] _5/172019] _5/212019]5/2212019] 6772019 01101101 148,740.82 14874082 | _ 148.690.82 148,690.62 | COAPICPAIDCCC
SR2018-01-00242; 19GL00036: SOUND SYSTEM __[ADMIN Public Biddin - 4018] - | 5R1r2019] 5217201 No bid submi 01101101 131.300.00 131,300.00 - - [COAPICPAIDCCC
SR2018-01-00280¢ 19GL00037: AIRCONDITIONER _|CONST, __|Public Biddin - 42019] - | 5212019 5212019 52872019 5/29/2019] 611472019 01101101 287,500, 287.500.00 |_267,000.00 267,000.00 [CONPICPAIDCCC
SR2018-01-00280¢ 19GL00036: OFFICE EQUIPMENT |ADMINICTS _|Public Bidding 5 a2019] - | 5212019] 5217201 Failed Bid 01101101 103.200.0¢ 103.200.00 = - [coamICPAIDCCE
[5Rz018-01-00280¢ 19GL00033; PHOTOCOPIER ___|CONST. ___|Public Bidding - 1412019 52372019]6/472019] __6/472019] _6/1072019]6/1172018] 6/25/2019 01101101 850,000.00 850,000.00 | _534,111.08 534,111,08 |CONPICPAIDCCC
SR2018-01-002806 19GL00040: 1.T. ACCESSCORIES gggxzwm Public Bidding - s14n019| - |srio19| srirots|  srorots|searots| emrmote g‘l 1 : 16955000 —— 16955000 | 167,540.00 —— 167,540.00 |conPICPADCCE
SR2018-01-002806 19GL00041: LT EQUIPMENT iDRS'I#””’CO Public Bidding - 5142019 5232019| 6/4r2019|  614r019|  6ror2019|6i1112019| 672502019 g: g . 50000000 ——  500,000.00 | 484,110.00 ——| 484,100 |CQAPICPADCCC
SRR016-02-005849 IGLO0042: JO: Repair Vehicle __|PDD Public Bidding - 572302010] - | 5/3072018] 5/3012019] _G/11/2019|6/13/2018] 61267201 0110110 133,456.51 13345651 |_ 12436724 124,367.24 | CONPICPACCC
SR2018.01-002247 GLO0043: JO: Repair of Machine [QAHD Public Bidding " 5123120 | 5302019 5302019 6/11/2019]6/13/2019] 7787201 01101 289,510.00 289,510.00 | 286,455.00 286,455,00 |CONPICPAIDCCC
B02.005849 GLO0044: JO: Repair of Vehicle |PDD/CONST. | Public Biddin 2 5028720 5 5/412019] _ 6/472019] _6/1072019]6/117201] 67247201 01101 223,531.19 223531.19 | 205,770.08 205,770,08 |CONPICPAIDCCC
03000385 (MOOE) |19GL00045: VARIOUS SUPPLIES |EMD PublicBidding s 5128720 - 5/42019] _6/472019] _6/1012019] 611172019 6/24/201 011011 12054034 12054034 | 120,297.00 120.297,00 | COAPICPAIDCCE
5-03-000365 (MOOE) |19GL0006: DIESEL/LUBRICANTS |EMD Public Bidding . 5128720 = 51412019] _ 6/472019] _6/10/2019]6/11/2019] 6/24/2019 1101101 855,780,00 855.780.00 | _763,37093 763,370.93 |CONPICPADCCC
Hidipdhecd 19GL00047: PREVENTIVE MAINT. |EMD Public Bidding - sBI2019| - |6H0019| 610/019| /1120196132018 62502019 o 37550000 |— 37550000 | 366,740.00 |——|  358,740.00 |conPICPADCCE
SR2018-01-002806 19GL00048: JO: Repair of Vehicle_|ADMIN Public Bidding 2 §112019] - | 61972019 61972019 6/2112019]6/2472019| 77812018 01101101 160.783.00 16076300 | _ 9185163 91,851.63 | COAPICPAIDCCC
|sRe018-01-002806 19GL00043: JO: Repair of Vehicle |MAINTJPDD_|Public Bidding : 61472019 - | 612172019 67212019 6/2612019]6/2772019]ON GOING 01101101 100,688.46 10088845 | _ 92,899.85 92,899.85 |COAPICPADCCC
[sRz018-01-002806 19GLO00S0: TRAINING SUPPLIES |MAINT Public Bidding - 6142019 - | 672172019 6/2172019] _672612019]6/2772019]ON GOING 01101701 126,697.00 126.697.00 | 124995.00 124,995.00 | COAPICPADCCC
[sRe018-01-002423 19GL00051: SOUND SYSTEM | ADMIN Public Bidding . 6142019 - | 61019 6212019 No bid submitied 01101101 131,300.00 131,300.00 - - |coapicramcce
[SRz018-01-002809, etc.__ [19GL00052: SECURITY GUARD _|ADMIN Public Bidding 672012019] 612412019] 77212019 71152018 _ 71152019 Cancelled Bid 01101101 8.943.931.00 5.943.931.00 < _ |coapicPamcce




Date of Receipt of Invitation Remarks
Code PROCUREMENT PMoO! Mode of Ustollnvited | iy | Sibopen s C[::;m (E:h:':gn:e
(UACSIPAR) RROGRAWPROJEGT EndUser | Procurement |  Observers | ¢ ference| Check | ofBids | Evalation | PoQ4l [ ™ | fomthe
L APP,
COMPLETED PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES
SR2018-01-002247 19GL00021: JO: Catering Services JADMIN Public Bidding [CONPICPAIDCCC 12972019] 12972019 112972019] 12972019
SR2018-02-002962 19GL00022: JO: Calering Services |ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 2222019| 2222019 22272019| 22212019
SR2018-01-002247 19GL00023: JO: Repair Vehicle _|PAIO Public Bidding |CONPICPAIDCCC 3132019 3132019] _ 3132019| _ 3/132019
SR2018-02-005649 19GL00024: JO: Repair Vehicle | PDD & QAHD |Public Bidding |CONPICPAIDCCC 3202019| 3202019] _312072019] 31202019
SR2018-01-002247 19GL00025: JO: Mailing Services_|ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 3202019] 3202019] _ 312072019] _ 31202019
SR2018-02-002962 19GL00026: JO: Catering Services |ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 3202019 37202019 31202019] 31202019
SR2018-01-002247 19GL00027: JO: Printing Services_|PAIO Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC annow|_annot| _ annos]  4nrotg
SR2018-01-002247 19GL00028: JO: Mailing Services ®|ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC aro19| aro19]  4mpots]  4mrotg
SR2018-01-002247 19GL00029: AVR ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC aBR019| 4/82019]  482019] 4812019
l&mwmn 19GL00030: JO: Repair Vehicle t%‘;‘g'} Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC ar8no19| 4rsrots|  4rmerots|  4rsrot
|SR2018-02-005849 19GL00031: JO: Repair Vehicle __|PDD Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 42872019| 412872019] _ 428r2019] 4282019
[sreot8-01-002247 19GL00032: 1D CARD CONSUM. _|ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 5072019] 57019 5Rr019| 527019
[sreotB01-002247 19GL00033; JO: Repair Vehicle |CONST. ___|Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 562019] 5/672019]  5/672019] 50672019
SR2018-01-002423 19GL00034: JO: Catering Services |ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 52172019| 5272019] _527R019| 52112019
SR2018-02-005849 19GL00035: JO: Repair Vehicle __|PDD Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 5/1572019) 5/152019] _ 5/152019] _ 5152019
SR2018-01-002423 19GL00036: SOUND SYSTEM __|ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 5/1572019] 5/152019] _ 5/152019] _ 51152019
|sRe018-01-002806 19GL00037: ARCONDITIONER _|CONST. __|Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 5/1572019] 5/1572019] _ 5/1572019] _ 511572019
|sR2018-01-002806 19GL00038; OFFICE EQUIPMENT |ADMINICTS _|Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 5/152019] 5/152019] _ 5/152019] _ 5152019
[SR2018-01-002806 19GL00039: PHOTOCOPIER __ |CONST. | Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC | 5/2172019] 52172018] 52172018] _ 5/2172019] 512172019
SR2018-01-002806 19GLO0040: 1.T. ACCESSCORIES [OROEMD b e Bidding [COAPICPAIDCCC 5/1512019| 5/152019|  51152019] 511512019
CONSTJADMIN COA/PICPA/DCCC
SR2018-01-002806 19GLO0041: I.T. EQUIPMENT :kammco Public Bidding ggmgim 5212019| 57212019 52172019|  SR2172019|  SR172019
SR2018-02-005849 19GL00042: JO: Repair Vehicle __|PDD Public Bidding | CONPICPADCCC 5312019| 5B12019]  5B172019]  5B12019)
[sRz018-01-002247 19GL00043: JO: Repair of Machine | QAHD Public Bidding | COAPICPADCCC 5312019 5B12019] _5B12019] 56172019
SR2018-02-005849 19GL00044; JO: Repair of Vehicle |PDD/CONST. |Public Bidding | COMPICPADCCC 5312019] 5312018] _ 5B172019] _ 56172019
SR2019-03-000385 (MOOE) | 19GL00045: VARIOUS SUPPLIES_|EMD Public Bidding | COAPICPADCCC 5/3112019] 53172019]  5B172018] 53172019
SR2019-03-000385 (MOOE) | 19GL00046: DIESELLUBRICANTS |EMD Public Bidding | CONPICPADCCC 5312019 5B312019] _5312019] 53172019
2%:3;&%‘23 19GL00047: PREVENTIVE MAINT. [EMD Public Bidding ggmgim S0 eapote|  emrots|  emr0t9
lsmowmmzsoe 19GL00048: JO: Repair of Vehicle |ADMIN Public Bidding | CONPICPADCCC 61772019] 6/172019] _6/172019] 611772019
|sRe018-01-002806 19GL00049: JO: Repair of Vehicle |MAINT/PDD_|Public Bidding | COAPICPADCCC 61202019] 6/202019] _6/2072019] 61202019
[5Ra018-01-002806 19GL00050: TRAINING SUPPLIES [MAINT Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 6/2072019] 62012019]  6/2072019| 612072019
[sre018-01-002423 19GL000S1: SOUND SYSTEM___|ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC 612072019] 6/2072019] _6/2072019| _ 61202019
[SR2018-01-002809, eto._| 19GL00052: SECURITY GUARD _|ADMIN Public Bidding |CONPICPADCCC | 5/3172019] 53172019] 53172019] _ 53172019] _ 53172019
Total Alloted Budget of Procurement Activities 18,307,062.68
Total Contract Price of if Cond d 6,618,767.36
Total Savings (Total Alloted Budget - Total Contract Price) 11,688,295.32
Prepared by:

CHARITO T. MERTENS
Head, Procurement Unit
Concurrent, BAC Secretariat




